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Isolation Order 

 
Isolation order for: _____________________ (Name) 
  _________________________(Address) 
  _________________________(Phone) 
 
Rationale for order:  Based upon a review and evaluation of your health status and risk of 
exposure, you have or are likely to have a contagious disease called Avian Flu.  You have not 
complied or have indicated that you will not comply with recommendations from the Public 
Health Department that you remain isolated.  
 
Order:  It is hereby ordered that you stay at home and have no visitors until the Health Officer or 
designee states that you are no longer contagious and a minimum of 10 days have passed after 
fever and cough are gone.  In addition, you must wear a mask at all times when in the presence 
of others in the home.  If you cannot wear the mask due to your medical condition, it is essential 
that others in the same room wear masks.  You must cover you mouth and nose with a tissue 
when coughing, sneezing, or laughing.  The places that you must not go include, but are not 
limited to, work or place of employment, school, church, a mall or grocery store or to a theater.  
If you need emergency medical care, you must immediately inform the health care personnel of 
your contagious Avian Flu condition.  Any non-urgent medical treatment must be delayed until 
you are no longer contagious. You will be subject to a medical evaluation by a public health 
official or designee to verify your health status. 
 
Legal Authority:  California Health and Safety Code, Sections 120175 and 120195 give the local 
health officer or her/his delegate the authority to issue orders deemed necessary to protect the 
public health and safety, or the health of any other person and to enforce the California law, 
which includes statutes, as well as rules, regulations, and orders of the California Department of 
Health Services. Section 120130 also provides the authority for the adoption and enforcement of 
isolation and quarantine orders.  The California Code of Regulations, Title 17, Sections 
2501,2516,2518, and 2522 requires the local health officer to take whatever steps deemed 
necessary for the investigation and control of reported communicable diseases.  This includes 
isolating any person who has a reportable disease and observing such persons to determine 
whether he/she is free of the disease for which he/she has been placed under isolation.  California 
Health and Safety Code, Section 120275 states that any person violating an order of quarantine 
or isolation issued by the health officer is guilty of a misdemeanor.  Under California Health and 
Safety Code, Section 120295, violation of this order can result in a fine and/or imprisonment in 
jail, for each day that the violation continues.  
 
YOLO COUNTY HEALTH OFFICER: ________________________________(Name/Date) 
Signature of Patient:_________________________________(Name/Date) 
 
I have explained the contents of this notice in person: ________________________(Name/Date) 

“Investing In Our Community’s Future” 
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